TH ATUEE www.govtpressmp.nic.in |
+ft oA s fFn S w €

HHE 360] M, wER, fEAis 24 3T 2019—9K 2, T 1941

fafy ik faurt & favm

i, f&Aie 24 STTE 2019

F. 14002-231-TFRIG-31(W. ) -31fe. —Aeawew faum @ # frafafaa sfufem g | feae 22 T
2019 FY TUE WEISA HI AR W & TH T, W, SR w SR ¥ oy R S .

qeAgRy % ToUUE % T Y AT SMQWIER,
T ared, stfafed afed,

719



720 ey Toas, feAid 24 TG 2019

weagayr st
HHE 9 T 0N
HETT ST heATuT T ((Heier ) sfufEE, Ro%R.

[ faies ] T, R0%R Y T SR WK g8, wﬁ“qmm(m)"ﬁm Q¢ 3,
20%% Y WIW AR W@ W 1

e aifuEs wean fif s, 9]¢3 WY T wehfd wE ¥ AfaFEm.
mw%aﬂﬁaﬁﬁmﬂﬁﬂﬁm—ﬁ%ﬁmﬁmﬁmﬂmﬁﬁaﬁmﬁaﬁ —
i . 2w e & i A AR S Fer (o) AAfufRm, 3023 R,

gt 8¢ W7 2 TR e Fe fifd s, 236 (I < W R3eR) (S 3ad TF TER
whrer. q\aafuﬁw%qmﬁﬁﬁ\z%)aﬁmzcﬁ,m(z)ﬁ,w“aﬂﬂmaﬂimm”%
wmm,w“m?ﬁvm_aﬁuﬁm“wﬁammﬁ.

R L 3. g st F oA R §—

' (TF) wem(z)ﬁ,v@“aﬁam"ﬂ:www“aﬁﬁam”wﬁama@

(@)  STEE () H, 1R e T ¥ A W, W CE e oy ey S,
g, feish 24 3T 2019

. 14002-231-SFRIE-HA(T.) - — 9@ F  HfTHr ¥ T 348 F WS (3) F ATH i weyey
sfasa Feam ffu (ehe) afufEm, 2019 (FHiF 17 T 2019) T ST AR ToATNA F wfywr 9
eI WY R ST €

HeTRs ¥ TSATE ¥ AH Y q«1 SR,
TSt Ared, i dfea.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
NO. 17 or 2019

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 2019

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 22nd August, 2019; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 24th August, 2019.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventieth year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2019.

Amendment of 2. Tn Section 18 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 9

Section 18. of 1982), (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty

rupees and fifty rupees”, the words “forty rupees and hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 3. In Section 19 of the principal Act,—
Section 19.
6] in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “forty rupees” shall

be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “hundred rupees” shall
be substituted; '

W,Wwamwm,mmmﬁaw, siiaret @ fsa ao WHRE—2019.



