ECICEL | ECA www.govipressmp.nic.in
Q oft S die foran <1 Wk R

HHI® 186] Nt YpRaR, fAiw 22 3@ 2016—3WE 2, UF 1938

fafyr ik faurt w@d faum
Oy, feqfe 22 31de 2016
, a»‘61451273613%@31—(91)m—mﬁaﬁwmﬁmﬁmmﬁqﬁmﬁmmmmcﬂﬁa2016
F TSI FRIZT H AN W € Yt €, TaggRl TSTHRY i ARt % fad yeifv fean s g

HeARRW % TAE F AW Y qA SRR,

mtruéwatf‘aﬁw

~ Ui R4 G 0%

Hmﬁmmmw Wedl a9 U9 (HIIEE )
arfufem, Q0§

ﬁw;gait.

wfae M.

oI 3 T TN
YT ¥ T HINE.
HRT ¥-TT I T,
T 4 BT A

R 4% T GINYA.
UM §-F HT GIMYA.
YRl §-W 1 T
YT §-71 T TMEM.
. YW \9 T HEEA.

. YR 9T hHT AT,

PN 6 ML X

-
Pa

371



372

TeqgRy e, fedier 22 s1dia 2016

wie =,
YT 3 T AP,

YT ¥ T UTier.

gRT ¥-T &7

HIYET FTUET/
et W
QI & T .

gRT - T

YRT &-%h T

Heayey STt

AR W G R02%

Wﬁmwwé‘aﬂ wwﬁrm(wﬁm)
Bﬂhﬁq Q028§

[ Rt 3% a1, R0%% WY TUUE i AT W g¥; orARr ‘woawdwr T (raewer)’’ #F fein
R AU, R0 T WAHAR WHIRTA @i TE. ]

TR FRET ST SR qad, W qer Y9 fufEm, 2jeR i ST weifua R o e

IRT TRTSE & wgued a9 A weaylw faum-ded grr frefafea w9 9 9w
sifufrafo 81—

2. T8 fufrem w dfea T Teayey. fauM wa1 WeR A, o7 qen YvH (SEEE)
stfufrm, 038 ©.

3. TEAURDT RIS TUT TEE e, ST AT S9rT APEw, 2297 (il © W %93 ) (S sad
w%m%a&ﬁwﬁamﬁﬁﬁe%)aﬁmww“ww"&wm v A

wenfue TRl ST,

3.ngrawf%rﬁamﬁraﬁrxﬁ, v Ui BT % T T, ies Yt e e fer g,

¥, YE AfufEm @ arr ¥-T % WE W, Frafatea aw wenfia @@t s, sl c—

“ 4-TT, TR U W UEE N BUT U e ATET,/ el Har faar s
. - s
w. T[T AR H aRT &« &1 A fewar S,
& T ST Y AT y-k ¥, —

(T&®) 3T ('Q‘V)ﬁ, 3ich qAT 91 ‘'§,000 iiwfﬁtﬁzr”%wmwaiaaaa{w
“ 0,000 faReeT’” Teanfua vy <id;

(3) m(ﬁ%)‘\f,?@”ﬁ"fw”aimﬂtW“WW"WWW@.”.
v, e fFEE w O &% §, IuEW () H,—
(Th) o I, v ' UE TR % T W, g ol g wenfue feRy

(3N Wmﬁ,‘wmtwm,wmmmaﬂtmﬁmﬁ#@a
g sia:tenfua fewar @y, steriq i —

i g oire B o Wi are T v whEr S S,



ey TS, ferim 22 3rdie 2016 372 (1)

¢. T fufE @ oW & W, 9 ' eE TR 3 WM W, I ' ORE TR WU T &-W AT
fopy TG 3T qut T S T O, er TR A ST Sl Awvee Prefafed wiw et S
Y, IteH —

‘g uRar dym W wfvad uie o wug wfear | S

Q. I TP &Y o &7 ¥, Vg TW R W T W, ¥eg UEE g wfim ST /T T

go.gaaxﬁxﬁwaﬁamxeﬁ, ITYURT( Q) W, g ' UIT &9R"' o T WY, I1eg QU GO’ & o ot Weite.
Tenfua fu g,

29, g1 P @t uwT © % ugee, Frefatad o et @t WG, St — 0 W o-@ T

ST
“\o-oh. A WEE W IAHA B UrE @ GUY UE IR fEar e, | ST ST

o, T 22 i 2016

. 6145-127-SFRE-31-(T.) -3 —uRa ¥ WAUR & DT 348 F WIS (3) F AW ¥, WeAWEW
fauM 9 9eE I, ST Ao YvH (SeeA) SfufRm, 2016 (R 15 T 2016) &1 ST SIgER ToAU ®
THHR & TAgERT JehIfvr fomen i 2.

TEAYRY % TSI F T W a9« SSUIEE,
T[T e, fafted wf=e.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT

. No. 15 oF 2016 .

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION
(SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2016

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Sections :

Short title.

Amendment of Section 3.
Amendment of Section 4.
Substitution of Section 4-C.
Deletion of Section 5.
Amendment of Section 5-A.
Amendment of Section 6-A.

Amendment of Section 6-B.

A A L o A o

Amendment of Section 6-C.

_
o

Amendment of Section 7.

—
[,

Insertion of Section 7-A.



372 (2) TR TSI, Tt 22 3 2016
MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 15 or 2016
THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2016
[Received the assent of the Goverhor on the 21st April, 2016; assent first publishéd in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 22nd ‘April, 2016].
An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972.
Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-seventh year of the Republic of
India as follows:—
Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of
Section 4.

Substitution of
Section 4-C.

Computer
Operator/
Orderly

allowance.

Deletion of
Section 5.

Amendment of
Section 5-A.

Amendment of
Section 6-A.

§

Amendment of
Section 6-B.

Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2016.

2. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words “ten
thousand”, the words “thirty thousand” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “thirty
five thousand” shall be substituted.

4. For Section 4-C of the principal Act, the following Section shall be. substituted,
namely :— ’

“ 4-C. There shall be paid to every member a Computer Operator / Orderly allowance of
fifteen thousand rupees per mensem.".

5. Section 5 of the principal Act, shall be deleted.
6. In Section 5-A ofthe Principal Act :— - -

@) in sub-section (1), for the figure and word “6,000 kilometers”, the figure and
word "10,000 kiloineters" shall be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (3), for the words “three thousand”, the words "four thousand “shall

be substituted.”.

7. In Section 6-A 6f the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

6] in the first paragraph, for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words “twenty -
: thousand” shall be substituted;
(i1) " in first proviso, for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be inserted namely :—

“Provided further that eight hundred rupees per month shall be added per year

in pension.”.

8. In Section 6-B of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand”, the words “eighteen
thousand” shall be substituted and for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that five hundred rupees per month shall be added per year in family pension.”.



TeyRy USYs, i 22 3189 2016 372 (3)

9. In Section 6-C of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand”, the words “fifteen Amendment of
thousand” shall be substituted. ) Section 6-C.

10. In Section 7 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “five thousand”, the Amendment of

words “ten thousand” shall be substituted. Section 7.
11: After Section 7 of the principal Act, the following Section shall be inserted, namely :—  Insertion  of
Section 7-A.

“J.A. “There shall be paid ex-gratia of rupees five lakh to the dependant of deceased - Ex-gratia.
member.”.

ﬁm,mwamﬁwm, TEYRE g YA S gRuerd, e § qfEa qe FRii|—2076.



