T JIEES www.govtpress.mp.gov.in
Y off T4 dre fFa <1 wear .

[

4

IS 250] e, HieraR, feqis 9 faamR 2025— 91K 18, W 1947

fafy R faurh =+ faam

99T, ﬁ?ﬁ g fgamt 2025

. 8590-159-TFRIT-3T (W.).—HeawRy faum aw =1 Frefaiea ifufem f5g = fie 3 faamer, 2025 #
T TRIGH H1 SANG Wi €1 Il ¥, TAggR TearERo & SHER & ol wehiva fepan < g

nmém%ma%wﬁamm
AR, Gi. e, 3tfafea dia.

499



500 Heyey e, fadie 9 faamr 2025

HeAyAyT Sfafem

THHE Q¢ T 03

YRAT @1 ( Heaua9T H9er ) AfRH=d, 03y

[ faaies 3 foamX, 0% ®Y TGUTA ST F[AA UTA gF; IAfa ' WeAYRI Teiws ( rwrawoer)”’
famier @ foawat, 2034 HT YW TRV i 7. ]

TeEWT TG T o] §T &7 W WA =T ifufm, 24%]% i R deifee q ¥ iffrm.
TR RS % fogwRE a9 § geawey faur-Hved g frafafes w9 # 97 sifufrafia g —

dfam W eiT 2. (R) =9 sifafem =1 dfw Tm YR @ (FeEuey dueE) sfafem, 0%y
.

() UE HEHRY USTA H SUF WhIYH Hi ARG § YA BN

TR T . TN TSU FI AN B B § AR W i, ¢’ (¢]R F HEAE R) (S 3EH
AT EU ww 8 3H% uvEd gel AUt % 9 9 fiE ¥) 9 sed s gvEn susfua Gfa F deifua fear s
TH=a wifkifEm,

94%% T HEAIE

3 T HIMEMA.

ST 2 3. @ bR Syt -F A -

e,
(1) o=ty d wiem (R) ¥, < ‘w9 U F WM W, W= D W@ euw”
()  T=T § H,-

(&) @E (¥) & s9@ve () H FHeam () ¥, v ‘T TR T’ F WH W,
weg ‘Ui gER TuT’’ weifia few S,

(A @ve (8 @) H Iv@Evs (TF) IR () F wH R, FEfafeas swave wnfua
fq wmd, sl —

“(wp) afg dfae gew 9e T B ¥9U
G T qF ©.

() Afe dfae goa 9 <" @ T 1 AR dH 6 e
A TIC 9 3 © W®d ge Hfad o #1 0.3 wiawe. "

(FF) @ve () % W |, fFeafdfaa gve i fee s, el —
“(S)  afe smgen Susy T A T El,—
(W) <ot e fifea € <[ Th §OR TUC e @A g

Yod® €9 EOIN B9 A1 3k 91 & AU
Tk &qdl,



Yy N9, feqish 9 faamR 2025 500 (1)

(2)
(¥)

(W)

(%)

()

(¢)

(R)

() W () & TH TR 9"
i T I T
el & fau

FTHE ¥ H, g () H, 9% TF TR U F WH W, =K 0= T8
T Ty fhQ S,
THT R F, FeW () ¥, UK 'TH TR ¢’ F WH W, I TE §6R
Tuq’ Tefya fe wd,

ITDE 3¢ F @UE (W) F ITEE (V) F N, Frfafad sTavs et g,
C‘Hﬂﬂ?l\:—

(@) sHEE (W) T weE & I <F o1 9ied [ @A
() % siwfa T A A %1 R wfaer.
T Y2 & foau

VT ¥-F -

(@) WS () % 9@ (TF) &, Fem () ¥, W v e 7! F
W, ¥ 58 TR 9T’ Tnfaa few e

(A)  @vE (F) F 3I5@es () H, Hiad () H, g ' 9R T F WA
R, Wk 'Y TR T’ wifug fey S,

(@)  @vE (@) % I9EvE (TF) #, Hied () H, I8 'S TR T9¢’’ & W
R, I ‘U9 TR TUC’’ w@fud fRy S,

(9R)  @ve (@) & s5Es () #H Fed () #, w1 T TR T’ % @
R, v 'S TR F9C’’ Tenfua few S

SR ¥¢ W, FeW (3) #, WERU-TE F, g A F wwEw, Wk 7

W F g H < F STH Gl F s=1 WY =

AT R H -

(TF) @S F F ITEUE (F) #, Haw () ¥, g 'Y TR 39" F WH R,
¥ g gk aq wfua R S

(@) TWIE W FITE@E (W) #, Hod () H, U5 TH TR T F WM
I, v ''uig B9R w9U’’ wifya feu S,

AT o H,-

(W)  @ve (F) H, Had () ¥, U= 'TH T9R w0’ F WH W, g ' TR
Tyu'’ wfua e S,

() WL (W) * I9@IS (]) T, & () H, I 'Y TR T’ F W
™, v Ui R w9T e feu S



500 (2) HeyRY e, feAie 9 faawr 2025

() @ve () #, STEe (Th) H, $ied () #, 9% T TR w0 F w@m
R, 7% 'Y TR T wnfiE R S

(FR)  @vE (¥) #, e () H, I 'TF TR I F WM R, 9 W TR
(9=)  @UE (9) ¥, Hiad () H, T ' TH TR T F WH |, I< 'S R
o'’ Ty feew wmd,
(R0) 3FWT 43 H Haw () §, % T TR ' F WH W, UK T TR
(2%) 3MT=D% &o H, Hiew () H, IR ""T&F TR T’ F WM |, I "3 &R
T’ wnita feg S,

S (R) AW &R A, W W A, FeW () IR ' TH R T F W W, q=w
"9 TR e’ wfia fee s

A, feiew 9 faamr 2025
3h. 8590-159-3FHIH-31 (WI).—HRd F WfIUH F T 348 & U (3) & I §, YRdT W (Heawy
o) srffam, 2025 (FHIR 18 WY 2025) I IS SIgAR THAUA  WUHR ¥ TACgRT Wi fofam < .

ALY & TSI & TH | 77 SR,
AT . T, sifaRea wfea.



Y oTuF, feqie 9 Rydwn 2025

500 (3)

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 18 or 2025
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

| Received the assent of the Governor on the 3™ September, 2025; assent first published in the ‘“Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 9% September, 2025. |

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the
State of Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment)
Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the
Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided.

3. In Schedule I-A to the principal Act,-

€)) in article 5, in column (2), for the words "fifty rupees", the words "two
hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

(2) in article 6,-

(i) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (e), in column (2), for the words "one thou-
sand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in clause (gb), for sub-clause (i) and (ii), the following sub-clauses shall
be substituted, namely,-

"(i) If contract value One thousand rupees
is upto fifty lakh rupees.

(i1) If contract value 0.2 percent of contract
exceeds fifty lakh rupees. value subject to a maximum
of rupees ten lakh.".

(111) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
"(h) If not otherwise provided for,-

(i) Where value is involved. Rupee one for every
ten thousand rupees or part
thereof of the value, subject
to a minimum of one thousand
rupees.

(i) For the cases not One thousand rupees.".
covered by (i) above.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act 11
of 1899 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Schedule I-A.



500 (4) YUY o197, fedid o RTawx 2025
3) in article 24, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five housand rupees" shall be substituted.
4 in article 32, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.
®) after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of article 38, the following sub-clause
shall be added, namely:-

"(iii)  for mining leases not 2% of the whole amount payable
covered by (i) and (ii) or deliverable under such lease.".
above.

(6) in article 41-A,-

@) in sub-clause (i) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "five
thousand rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(i1) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(iii)  in sub-clause (i) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

@iv) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words
"one thousand rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

@) in article 48, in column (1), in explanation-1, after the word "grandson",

the words "and in the event of death of brother, his wife and children"
shall be added.

(8) in article 49,-

@A) in sub-clause (a) of clause A, in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(11) in sub-clause (b) of clause B, in column (2), for the words "one
thousand rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

{9) in article 50,-

1) in clause (a), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(1i) in clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two thousand
rupees” the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(iii) in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), in column (2) for the words
"one thousand rupees" the words "two thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.



TeYe Xrorv4, fedie o Riamvy 2025 500 (3)

@iv) in clause (¢), in column (2) for the words "one hundred rupees”
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

~) in clause (f), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(10)  in article 53, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(11)  in article 60, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(12)  in article 63, in clause B, in column (2), for the words "One thousand
rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

iz, TP T AT WET AREf, AR §RT IS SRg RN, Wit ¥ iR T YhTRa—2025.



