T8 GEEES www.govipressmp.nic.in
¥ ot = ot fa o S &

PHID 5] T, FTeraR, faid 7 STHaR! 2025—41Y 17, D 1946

ey ek foumrht »d o
qgrer, fadid 7 ST 2025

. 455—1—SFBNA—3T (J1.).— AT fee it o1 fferRaa arfifm o oR i 6 Wiaet 2025

TS B AU B AW W Al ARAGAR,
IR, G T, IR .



10

TURY Ios, feAi® 7 SeRl 2025

wftrg M qen

gRY

wiaag

sftrfrafafaat

BT G,

g f3T.

Ty e Irferfas

B 9 T R0RY

qyey we fagarg (Susel &1 Hened) g, 0y

[ Ri% 6 Sad), 2025 & WSATTA P AN UK §F; ATAM, “HAWRW W0 (SrETETRON)” ¥ feais
7 SEEY), 2025 @1 YUHAR YA @1 WE. ]

meamRe ¥ S oif RARAT ok Sg Rore @ oy feard sl o &1 9T 9 S S 9
IR RGP JIETRY 9§ § TRy RuF—avsd gRT MR WY ¥ 9E AR 8 -
9. (9) Tu ffrm o e T ARy oW fivare (Suat o1 denE) s, k03¢ 8

R TF Y ARG | Fg B R AR WRER, oA # ARRGE gRT R #R SR SR
¥ Sfvafaa = sffgdl & Wi weemt & fog sem—ere ard faa &1 o wd.

Q.&ﬂ?ﬁr?ﬁaﬁaﬁ(a)ﬁmmﬁaﬁ,aﬁw&)ﬁaﬁm@mwsﬁ?aﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ,mﬁsﬂﬁﬁ
fpam STar 2.

3. 39 AMfTE gy Rl SRFRRR @ e 9, 5 o oY w, Rret PR smaffafy
AL B S ], wftdfera srerar ffde F1 g 8, g = g9,

3R ffrw, o ¥ B T$ @ g T R 9 @) e, sfaftm, wrd ar gk
1 od ¥ & e, g @1 Sua R ¥R, &9, aemer a1 S A1 Sue ey A fhd SR
1 STl A fre o, TG, areEdn, S, <@ A A A Sew R FERe o 9eEs @ gd |
B e R AR @1 qoere § Py U RN B a9 & WEE W, TG T SRR IR uAE
P A @ A Rigia a1 Fm a1 il sfeRa, sffees @ vu § @ ogpa R, usfa ar
wfpar a7 Reme ven, wfe, RRIwReR, frdwm, e, 95 a1 fgfe W 39 91 @ 81 gY W wa el
ST 5 97 waw: R W APy grn, o 5 aegr, PRRT @ T 8, S a1 o e
Ay § g fbar a1 ¥ A AAIE § AT GO €
ReRIeR, frdwm, B, vor, vefd, wihar o1 o vy a1 a @1, &Y 3@ fewE a1 wew 9 R, O
FacT AT AT T8l .

e
EmT R 3fEm)

HAk 9% HAID i = RHICE

@) (3) ()

Ro9IR

Qo003

99 HRIUQY g Yoob 9T 99 ¥, g “d 98 A W, A Ui §9R ®OY T BT B B,

arferfee, ’-20‘;? TUSH BN, @ WM W, ¥ ‘A 99 W UiE R wUY B ARG
AfERINT @ Smeefi, werfad fdy S,
€ HeweE SEiied (9) sreary W ¥, ¥R—38 @ gvan, FefoRed awr sidenfia o
FHBR HeT] g, eterfq —
affas, 2003 “3§—. STURE HT IHA.—

() P ARBE, S AW wERER F e ool v T 8, Al
5 g ERT ARG N1 WiRga frar S, 59 AR @
Sl Ufharall @ YeIue & gd a7 u¥Enq 39 A B T 3y 79
35 D HT B D IWH | IR Afe BT T A & G W
IR 5 I e BT RAfkT @ s, wemE & o agerd Y
DI



YT Woius, fadid 7 e 2025 10 (1)

HEe  dY4  HHG e =

RE(ICET

()

®)

@®)

(%)

)

EN

9ER9

99

OIS TEBN
arargel afRfeaH, 9ego

() 39 ARfEm & orfi AR B AR W foell feram, Yok, N
T4 IR SR RffE 37 ) I B Hem |, IR 1S 1, R wi
T ADBR TR Su—FrW @ onf\ g SuUefd, IHE B U iy
® HE" WR—

(@) sTaerl) st V& afiom & forg <l 8 & ek

(@) afz o5 W s g1 gEie fF @fs & Reg 7va W
& dRera & o g }, O YT afe W eREE 4 SRk

(3) ORI ve— ¥, SWRT (}) & e W, FfeRaa SuurT wenfud
MY, :ﬂeﬂﬁ —

() aft T Afe WWRgR & wHer a1 5 W Al & wwe s
&5 IFRER ERT WP fHar T4 &), URT ¢& B STRT (9) B el
BIs WO AP A B W RO, T IS TR ST (9)
& orfiT S9 @Rp T I &, WG B W FTHR B AT fHe W
e FT o {6 SN SWRT () B IR # MRER A1 IMRER
ERT MRpa 63 T e g7 fFar o, IR A W TR R,
RER a1 PRER R Wiipa fear T AlRs 6 SR Bl
TR B HHT 3R IR g V& FoE, S (& widare # e
SR, G B uTErq @l B T wRa 9, S wE s w9l
¥ e = gl ARRIfT v |

R) URT ©:—@ #H, SR (}) & AU fbar o,

() srarg wai # e o @ Wi & W w, e
s b1 e verfia frar oy, st -

"grq<rer, Afrafimarg, gvs w9 wmRaar”
(3) ORT 03 B %o W, FEfRed gt wnfiT @ o], st —
"9¥. U — SH RfRm & pfl9 R g, afe——

(as)aﬁ's‘ﬂ'aaaiﬁsamams aﬂgaﬁmmmm
IS fipar RO F=ar & o1 fieyr GRS § A1 oY 3@ H
A W P bral € A R o 9 9§ e 8 4@

(@) Frel |aEe) BT B ANBRY I W B IUIT A BIIS B
R a1 el A @t @, R A 98 fegag 2, SwNT 1 wrER
@ forg, fod ey @fth @& AW SUR & SFgEax RieRe Hwar
? T S QYR R FAT & AT

@) 1S AfBr AT B T bl g, TS TR A wRegfot
FRAT 2 TSB! [ @l ® A1 9T T Y S, Rpa Y o,
Rafda ) T, ST frgrexe B3 9 a1 998 T W S
F weff & ar IeEd @ ) TR, o TWE 91 TRES ¥
1S frar @1 Fueyl Al Hvar ¥ a1 Yar f5d o F el 8




10 (2)

YUY ouF, faAld 7 STFaRl 2025

HHe  q§ BB wfereg _

e

(%)

®)

)

)

(©)

@) o wow W@ TRy 31, T ) 5 aasd F gfds s
2, STl YA AT ¥ T B FOw 7 AWHT 1 FHAR AT DI
=Rp faehg, ST=RUl, =T, T NI AT 3T (Y] THRT BT FIH
Aragd) & Wl BT AUTET B B HUCSE! AR | BT & Al

(S) S BIS T HUSS 34T USIRIGRA & fatead & gd, <RM
I SEP UL Bls W AR AT T A

@) B¢ AP 9u A @, e 5 a8 e €, g,
Sifrerdl, =T, iRy T ST HRIRT T SAARETOT R ¢3 AT Yo &
o frge 5y T 5 afs & eggeR T v g,

WEHNU— 39 RT3 WA @ fg, W e @1 wew @,
S Y g uRT F ffdse fan R, sfia gy e SR
a7 aqd Ae | e,

(¢) 9RT ©¢ P T, FrefaRad 98 gRT Sia<enltg ® W,
It —

"9y—p, IrfTafdadrg.—
Tg Rfem & orlw safaar &Ff, afe—

@) sl Pt Sasdt @ o eiee™ wUE e arem 318
=Ifth SS9 3ieEr B, 99e) Wi & diqg AT & Hiax wegvew =
TEERT o wifed, i TR J6, G TN gEer % 4@
) STPER gaq 95 § A T8 PR ®; AT

@) < Fomds dvsd @ R siwem U8 o e 18
e A HrTSe) @ AWM [ BRAT § AT AT Dl DREAR B A
I AOR B A HRT & AT

@ g AVBR T Ps Few, oS TN AEHR], EASEGEI
ey 81, VA THBRT THgFHR el <l AT V) GEIe <AT BITol
T3 YT e BT & AT WORER GRT ERT €3, e, ¢E, §o, & TIT 0o
3 el fges a1 Wi f5d Tg f6xN =ofth &1 \wergar =18l BRar
%,'?JT

@) B e gur W Fee @ R W 1 SR a6
e, ysue, AT a1 oy ARNERY A7 JAMHAT gRT ¥ B SIIRT
() @ usHl BT IgUET F ¥ W SR B R > A1 L
ar

@) @ @fp fFl W TR FIS ORT o B IYERT () B
SN AR B e B, Sl BRaT § AT SWD 376 H GOROM BHRAT
%;HT

@) el ARIEel BT S ARG T WEw AT FIs ARG DIy WA
B frEl & Seeie § wwar §; @

(@) s @Ry SHgwaY a1 & e giegs sror & 6 @,

e AT 39 ARfgH @ Susel @ aefie W fey T Rt
e sew @) IasT BT ®; AT




TS X0, fadi® 7 SHek) 2025 10 (3)

HHF a4 HHD e A9

RSEISR

()

®)

(®)

)

(%)

.

EA-Ee)

9

megyeyr aienfie
ey orfifH, 9ego

) @1% fraee o i 5l i sRoT 4, S9N 99D
FHER | FET TE GH B 99 aRIE ¥, e fF W @R a1
T B dies B9 B Broal @ AR Gl Tear | S e
PR F WA IEAl .

WT— 9 ORT &y @ forg, W IfRer a1 9w 3,
S 6 g urr § e fear man 2, sifa genRerf sy st
pU e R G B ) L |

(&) ORT vy & WH R, P arT wenfia #1 o, sl -
9y, IR B foy v~

el RS B A Gade Aed, SUST TAE ANGR Al
g BN A G A1 AT IR AT B BHAN AT gd
T A1 BIS I i, e T SRiaE) €, S {6 aoaE wad
e R & opf Sws fog B 1 wF 81, Hage o S
7 gRT 0y F SfeeRaa foxl srRe @ forg At oY oM R W
Wﬁﬁﬁm&o,ooo/—ﬁmﬁﬁw,aﬁsﬁmﬁﬂ

(o) T 9y @ gTa fEfREad 95 a1 SidRenfiq @1 W,
sreaf —

"9y—a, Afaftgaret © fav wmiRa—

A A B TR Ade A, SUBT T-E ARMGRI I1
g BN T W AT S e AT Bl HHAr A1 qaqd
HHAR) AT BIg 3y @R, e T IR W, S 6 aoma w9
e A & opfle owe Reg A o1 wad &), wiiae E el
A uRT We—F I SfeelRad afvafiqar ¢ fog IRRER grRT W=
Wﬁﬁ%ﬁmﬁﬁmmmﬁ?ﬁ@?&,ooo/—ﬁm
(9) URT €3 B TN, AT das F FAfaRaa a/T Sgl S,
it —

"£3—P. AURT BT IHA—

PIS IWFHTY S 59 geier @ = Soft &1 7 &, iy = 5w
YT G ARG ERT Mg fHar o, 59 oRfrem & enfl
yfharell & %emas & g9 A1 U¥ER 39 SR B R <8, <V, T,
<€, €0, £9, €2 Td €3 D W B B AW J IR =afRp 1 w4r
IR B Weg ® ok fF 9w ifdgEeT g1 ffed @1 S, wEE
P fIQ ogew B B

R) 39 ARfEm & T IR A R | el Al <7 & iy
3 Hew W, At B 7, iR uiied e gRT Su-frE (9) @
T TR S9ERd, TET @1 W IR B ey w)—

@) e el W afrEe @ fog sl 8 &N el



10 (4)

ST XTo9, fie 7 SO 2025

He  T¥  HHIG e

FENEE

(%)

®)

@)

(¥)

(©)

'z

EA3.4

R3

WYY TRUToTdh
= arfafeam, 9eys

(@) afx P A PR T g fhe s @ aeg gwe & WRed
S B T A v Afts W wriaE SR fbar sme

(3) ORT 98%, 98&, 30R, 3I, 38, 3I¥Y, IVE, IE—F ¥ T
"Iefers” & W W, Weg “wRG’ wifid fhu &g,
(R) gRT 990 3R 999 BT A9 Far WS,

(3) IRT Roo | Weg MRATTE” B WM W, ‘RT3 v "uim |
P WM W IR "UE TR @i by g

(8) 9T 09 @ WM R, AfaRad awT wenfig @ oy, serfq —

"R09. WA & famm W& fomar &1 ffo a1 afeds
P~ S Pl AMGH B IR @ a1 e  Ffza ey o et
H WM 9ol ATl §9IGT ® AT 9ATGT 8, A7 SWH URddT dxar ® AT
IRadT Fxarar &, O S UE F9R BU¢ 9@ @ O o sftsa
foram STEE o TAT FIE W @y gET B SN, W S geRenfid
T F HIRT g3 BN

(¥) 9RT R385 § SWRT () ¥ Tsg “oefgve” & WM R, TR 3R
g U Al B WE W IS U gRC w@iia fhr .

(c) URT 338 # ¥rg "3pfgve” & WM WR, ‘TR’ &R ¥ "uiw |
P M R I UiE TR ¥eug fhu o

(©) N1 33¢ B WM W, FEfiRea aRT w©nl| @1 Sy, sl —
33¢ g & & wEl &1 Rmerr wen-

(9) @I W A, @ A ATt I S9 Ry i gl @ e
IGT a5 e wfs ) weEly @ R e f—us, g,
Te-ud, PR o1 o e @ Reew w1 wwEE R
TEH, HaE, WOIR, U, &, IEW AT R P WeR AT 99 W
TG ST ST 3ferar fadl A W w9+, 4R, U, O,
BRI AT BR WR WSAT a1 1 3 71 ol Y oy Qfy & foramm,
a7 39 var, fawld @ Rt s, & TRa 9 gved 8
S 1 BOIR ¥UY, G B GHal .

R) STRT (9) ¥ fAfd< fHW 919 & T W N MYH SHS! A=A
& fam1 wrdwife gEa—ua gR el ff fAffe a=it o1 959 W
T off was a1 waT o 9, AR, g8, AR, I AT BN @
SwEr g = 93T W AdRe GEa-ud & ueE a1
A =afts, SHS! o gsm & fa=m, ar

Wl 319 & Sewad # fhar € 999, dER, ¥, T, I/ A

@ Sooad # frdl | wad, SlaR, 987, I, SRR 91 BN BT SUINT

FRaT 2, @ U R o S E9R FUY, 9% B 9adl © AT Y

IR TR Ieded ! ¢ # U9 IR 99, | gUs+ig s8R
(c) URT 333 &, Teg " FefTTS” B WM W, WK, WK U A D
WM R IE 79 goR’ AR I8 1@ B ®H R®, TE 4G
fia fdar e



HOYSY o197, fTid 7 SHaR] 2025 10 (5)

HHe  9Y  HHP g AH

RsHIE

(%)

®)

@®)

(¥)

(1)

&

9L

39

YT IR TdhT
e, 9€59

(£) URT ¥Re @ ¥F WR, frfRad o1 venfod @ oy, st —
"g3c. SUfaferal @ W ® fag wfsar—

(9) URT $=9 & T IU-RAY 1T T A T 9 B @A
FX TH 5 ITE] DS Tooltd IT Seorgd & g MicasT—

(@) Y TRa & S dig §9IR BUY, T P T FHIT FAT Al &
Trer 7 @Y e § W e 9, W v W o oy qwffE 3
TRy W T @ v s dNE T A 38, T |t
YA, TH B B FDAL; AT

(@) T TR/, S Te W R B fon, e g B ek
J Seoied B I 7 @ B fofad gEe T g B uwEg

R) W TR B Iqal a7 IuD AJIRIRG, Mg, IodieT B alel
HY, 9! 9% o@a! wRe § |, Rt &1 aRAeH o= &7 Ry
BT,

(90) TIRT ¥3¢ ¥, e “3refgve’ & I W, W& ARG w@fia fbar

Y T SR () @ M W, FrefRed SusmT venfid a i,

i —

R) BTE 9 N SR (9) D @WrS (@F) A7 (3M) B N febedl AT aroRmEr
%7 RIEEIY SERIT W & TTaTd VAT JTURTY &=l X, e o
@, W wRa ¥ &Rd g W S arell @ e efa |

(9) URT 93¢ AT R H, T FAMAT & WF R, ea "R
zenfua fey g

R) R 0¢ F, T AT P WIF W AR, TE gE= Qb
WM R ¥ U FOIR @it fdy S

3) ORT 9 #, T "SEET B WH W, TR R T wiE A
P WM W AT I gOR” Wi fdy g

(¢) OIRT 9cy &, Teg 'S & WM R, A€ "ARG7, T8 "Il
zerfa ey <.

(¢) aRT 929 H, T “GAMT F WE R, TE ARG T A< TH
TR B WMF W, T UiE FOR’ WU By o

(&) GRT 9€3 ¥, TTeg AT B W W, TR WA, TK "] AL A
O B W W, A€ F TR TAT ARE A D W R, AR
TN eua Y S

(9) URT 9&c ®, I "GAMT B WM W, TR ARG, A TR
TN B M W, UG T A a g @i fey ol

() ORT R ¥, T FAMT B WM W, TR ARG, FUOl AR
e B WM W, T "I | JUT TEN wnfia Y o,

(e) &IRT 3R ¥, T "GEFT B WM W, & AR, TA = @
P WM R, UK TP ok’ WU fby g,




10 (6)

YT o7, f&A1H 7 SHaN 2025

HHH  IY  HHD <yt A

NNICR

(%)

®)

@®)

(%)

(%)

(90) URT R3¢ H, TF "FAMT B WM R, AKX "R, T| "T=4"
B WM R, A< UG A 7O I8 T B WE R, IR TN
g fhy o9,

(99) URT Ry H, TR GAMT B WM W, TR ARG, T© TR
TN P ORIE W, ¥ U9 Al wenfig fey S,

(93) U1 R385 F, TR GAAT B W W, TF AR, TR e
P WM W, UK "I A T 9N Y IR T B R W, Th
‘T=RT” ¥erfid fhy WY

(93) UIRT R3€ F, g “GAMT D WM R, UK AR, g TN
P WM W, T "I Al a1 gar” g Ry A,

(9%) IRT Wo H, T "FAM" T W R, TF "MK, TRF T
B WM W, UK U Gl qRl e U $ N W, e gEr”
g fée w9,

(9%) ORI R F, T A" B WM R, UK TR, TR TN
@ TIE W, ¥ TV QN TAT TEN TAT oG U B I W, IR
(98) URT ¢y H, IR FEMAT B WM W, TR WRA, TR wAE”
® WM W, T TE Q9 K U 9 B WM R, I 9l
FUIR’ <efug feu <Ig.

(99) ERT R0 B SWRT () #, TR A" & WM R, UK WK,
T T TIN B WM W, T T |9 i e 9.

(3<) URT R0 T SWRT (3) & wH W, FAAfaRaa o1 enfia ot
S, perfe -

") folt v @ Wy § SWIRT () & 3R SRy wnfia & 9
W I TRATAS AR I IFG §RI WG ARGN, fbg
T TEY, W A BT §8 TR T ;MR M &R TguR TH I
FT 39 THR STANT I B fow @fRedl & g s a1 e =
IUTF HEM R VAT u@S Afts o fFW wE B 4] B 9 @
T YPR ARY RY I & 9eaq SHHT T UHR STANT HEM AT
FHT DY I <L, 9 AR 9, T I W Pl g8 I D 8
TBR MR & o & JeEn, @ V4 IS &7 & fog s Rm
T I WM & $H TSR SUAN AT IR I A7 T SN BT
B I T, YA IUY TS & GHAN, qfVsd (HAT S

(9€) URT K, B SWRT () H, TK AT & WM |V, TF AT,
TIT T U B WM W, ¥ ‘uiE | wenfd fFy S

(Re) URT ez B SURT (8) b W™ R, FrfeRad aRT wenfia o
1Y, Gﬁeﬂﬁ —

“(&) fordll wre & Hay # SWIRT (¢) & onfie Jfifg wenfud & o=
W & TRUAST AR a1 996 g} Wigd fer, g
T TE U WIF B, T8 T T MM M AR agulk T wrA
1 forg ftrdl 3 Fge e A1 o I v SR Y RS
ofth, o W WM $ 95 B &1 39 FOR AR¥ Ry & &
eI SUBT 99 39 FOR A STANT S AT TR B 3T <,




YUY o194, fedid 7 S9av 2025 10 (7)

HHE  d¥  HAD At A

RSHICET

()

®)

®)

(=)

(©)

9.

9€93

N

WYY TR qAT
e ume g
e, 9ew3

T8 WG 9, S 99 WM B, I8 IR B S TSR AR 8 gobel
B ygE @ W IS 39 & forg e dRM 98 99eT 39 9eR
SRINT BT SN X T VT SUANT SR D1 gl <, T By

(R9) URT R ¥, T GAAN B WM W, T AR, T T2
P WM W), TE UG G qA I T B W W, TE AN
wefia fég S

(R3) GRT 93 FH IR (8) P WH R, Fefaiag g wenfig @
TG, PRI

"(3) SUYRT (3) @ N Bl < & ey ¥ Soiud B dlel W
e ARUTTRT SIRHNY AT IHH gRT Mg FARer, oy sraer
TE W @I Bl g% X I BT AT 97 IR TgUR U @I By
T YBR SUENT b B forg @aftndl w1 fges B ar g SuY
HRL".

(23) URT c3 B SWRT (R) B ¥ W, AR gRT e @1
\_!‘ITQ,STQIfT-[:—

"(R) o I ST (9) B i gaT Ry S B wwEi fHdl s
7 I 7 Ol A SUGET B B ST S S uS 3 g
=@ § 97 S Sfgd, W@rRed 1 |Wuiy & fog e €, Wik |
ST 37 & U e @l B e, der W o mRa 9, S 9 T
o & forg forae) verw Qefify & o & uear Y1 YA oA
(k%) IRT Rc3 B SWRT (¢) B T R, FefaRaa arr wenfu &
TG, SR —

"(6) ST P g d Q7 A ol & FdRT 7/ B SR AT
I & yeargd BN fog WM @ uwEr fE (Rl TRt F,
o W sufafl aoamm wgg € o o, R R e
arzea, W gRRerfer fod ok W &3 a1 uRes, Rie day 4,
W SR B foy i we B S wadh €, 9% WaM &R
¥ goR fpar o "o B, 9 foifda fFar o wear € a1 9%
TTed foRaT o wedr §, fafed oxe) §, SwwT (3) 7 afta fee of
v @ forg sl v @1 SUANT BRI, 98 WG W S o 6
TR qF P 8 gad, gur Wi MR Wl |, o W e T B
forg, e o R @ UvET VET SR AT W8, TATd B4y
RY) ORI cy ¥, wF GAMT B WM W, AR AT, FAT TR
TN PRI W, K Ui |l @it fhy ST

(RE) URT 300 ¥, T "ANNEE” B WM R, TF T TR CTb!
ARBTA”, g ST B W W, TR WK, TA G T B
WM W), U= Ui 9 wfia Py S

YRT 99 P SYYRT () HT &g fFar o,



10 (8) Ty o9, feFid 7 ST9a8) 2025

HAG G HHD fere A Feer
(9) R @ () )
<. 9693 ¥8  AEIYQY AN URT 3€ B UgEn, FrfoRed o siawenfa oo
RS S, refi
IafTH, 9e93 "3E—. JMYTY BT IHT—

(9) 39 STRIFEH T URT 98 DI SWRT (), TR 3¢
TAT GIRT 3€ BT Sooied BN R IVNER, AREHA
B qrenl A/ weiRer / afe gRT WU |
TR Ul A @ AN B PE B R, SWRRD
Sfeaiflad a1 & rf9 S Swied & T Bl
R) SwRT (3) @ onfim gor RAffie i R
P TG Ux,  @AfaHE I qre
wfafer / Teier / afts B SR SfeaRad gl
P 3nfi I oot W e o f&am S qer

0ure, fadie 7 SHaR 2025
F. 455—1—SFPIF— (IL)— MR & WA D AT 348 S WUS (3) & IMIERY ¥, FAURLY
S favary (Suadll &1 GueE) ARfEH, 2024 (HHiE 1 W 2025) BT IS FFATE ST b HIEIBR
A YAegRT YHIRG fhar o &

YR & U & A W Tl SMRTgNR,
IR . W, R i



TSy ouF, faAid 7 SHaN 2025

10 (9)

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 1 or 2025

THE MADHYA PRADESH JAN VISHWAS
(AMENDMENT OF PROVISIONS) ACT, 2024

[ Received the assent of the Governor on the 6™ January, 2025; assent first published in the ‘‘Madhya

Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 7 January, 2025.]

An Act to amend certain enactments for decriminalising and

rationalising offences and to further enhance trust- based governance for
ease of living and doing business.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the seventy-fifth

year of the Republic of India as follows :-

(1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Jan Vishwas
(Amendment of Provisions) Act, 2024.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Government of
Madhya Pradesh may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint;
and different dates may be appointed for amendments relating to
different enactments mentioned in the Schedule.

The enactments mentioned in column (4) of the Schedule are hereby
amended to the extent and in the manner mentioned in
column (5) thereof.

The amendment or repeal by this Act of any enactment shall not affect
any other enactment in which the amended or repealed enactment has
been applied, incorporated or referred to;

and this Act shall not affect the validity, invalidity, effect or
consequences of anything already done or suffered, or any right, fitle,
obligation or liability already acquired, accrued or incurred or any
remedy or proceeding in respect thereof, or any release or discharge
of, or from any debt, penalty, obligation, liability, claim or demand,
or any indemnity already granted, or the proof of any past act or thing;

nor shall this Act affect any principle or rule of law, or established
jurisdiction, form or course of pleading, practice or procedure, or
existing usage, custom, privilege, restriction, exemption, office or
appointment, notwithstanding that the same respectively may have
been in any manner affirmed, or recognised or derived by, in or from
any enactment hereby amended or repealed;

nor shall the amendment or repeal by this Act of any enactment revive
or restore any jurisdiction, office, custom, liability, right, title,
privilege, restriction, exemption, usage, practice, procedure or other
matter or thing not now existing or in force.

1. Short title
and
commencement.

2. Amendment
of certain
enactments.

3. Savings.



10 (10)

YUY Yo7, feAid 7 ST9aRl 2025

THE SCHEDULE
(See Section 2)

SIL Year

(O]

No.

3)

Short Title

)

Amendments

©)

1. 2012

2. 2003

3. 1961

17

17

Madhya Pradesh Vidyut
Shulk Adhiniyam,
2012

Madhya Pradesh
Asangathit Karmkar
Kalyan Adhiniyam, 2003

Madhya Pradesh
Cooperative Societies
Act,1960

In Section 11, for the words‘ he shall be punishable
with fine which may extend to five thousand

rupees”, the words“then he shall be imposed
with a penalty of rupees five thousand”, shall
be substituted.

(1) After Section 36, the following Section shall

be inserted in Chapter VII, namely:-

“36-A. Composition of offence.-(1) An officer
not below the rank of Labour Officer, if so
authorized by the Labour Commissioner by noti-
fication, may either before or after the institution
of proceedings under this Act, permit any person
charged with an offence to breach of Sections 35
and 36 of this Act to compound the offence on
payment of such sum as may be prescribed by
the said notification.

(2) On payment of amount of any contribution,
duty, tax, cess and legal dues towards the
employee under the Act, if any, and on payment
of such amount of compounding, as provided
under sub-section (1) by the authorized officer, -

(a) the offender shall not be liable to any
prosecution; and

(b) if any such proceeding has already been insti-
tuted against any person as aforesaid, such
person shall be discharged of such proceeding.”.

(1) In Section 59-A, for sub-section (2), the
Following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-
“(2) If any such person refuses to produce
before the Registrar or any person authorized by
him under sub-section (1) of Section 59 anybook
or papers which it is his duty under sub-section
(1) to produce or to answer any question which
is put to him by the Registrar or the person
authorized by the Registrar in pursuance of sub-
section (1). the Registrar or the person authorised
by the Registrar may certify the refusal and the
Registrar may, after hearing, any statement which
may be offered in defense impose a penalty not
exceeding fifty thousand rupees to the defaulter.”.



Hegyeyl Yo, fAid 7 SRl 2025 10 (11)

(1)

)

€))

@

€]

(2) In Section 72-B, sub-section (2) shall
be omitted.

(3) In Chapter IX, for the existing Chapter head-
ing, the following Chapter heading shall be
substituted, namely :-

“OFFENCES, IRREGULARITIES,
PUNISHMENTS AND PENALTIES”.

(4) For Section 74, the following section shall be
substituted, namely: -

“74. Offences.- It shall be an offence under this
Act, if-

(a) a Board of Directors or an officer or member
thereof willfully makes a false report or furnishes
false information or dishonestly fails to maintain
accounts or dishonestly maintains false accounts; or

(b) any officer of a society willfully recommends
or sanctions for his own personal use or benefit
or for the use or benefit of a person in whom he is
interested loan in the name of any other person; or

(c) an officer or any member destroys, mutilates,
alters, falsifies or secretes or is privy to the
destruction, mutilation, alteration, falsification or
secreting of any books, papers or securities, or
makes or is privy to the making of any false or
fraudulent entry in any register, book of account
or document belonging to the society; or

(d) amember fraudulently disposes of property
over which the society has a prior claim or a
member or officer or employee or any person
disposes of his property by sale, transfer,
mortgage, gift or otherwise with the fraudulent
intention of evading the dues of the society; or

(€) whoever, before, during or after the election
of members of the Board of Directors or office
bearers adopts any corrupt practice; or

(f) an officer willfully fails to hand over custody of
books, records, cash, security and other property
belonging to the society of which he is an officer,
to a person appointed under section 53 or 70.
Explanation.-For the purposes of this section
an officer or a member referred to in this section
shall include past officer or past member, as the
case may be.”.



10 (12)

AU o9, fedid 7 STHaN) 2025

(1)

@)

€)]

“)

(€)

(5) After Section 74, the following new section
shall be inserted, namely: -

“74-A. Irregularities.—It shall be an Irregularity
under this Act, if-

(a) any person collecting share money for a
society information does not deposit the same in
the Madhya Pradesh State Co-operative Bank
Limited, a Central Co-operative Bank, an Urban
Co-operative Bank or a Postal Savings Bank,
within fourteen days of its receipt; or

(b) a person collecting the share money for a
society information makes use of the funds so
raised for conducting any business or trading in
the name of a society to be registered or
otherwise; or

(c) an officer or amember who is in possession
of information, books and records, willfully fails
to furnish such information or produce such books
and papers or does not give assistance to a
person appointed or authorised by the Registrar
under sections 53, 58, 59, 60, 67 and 70; or

(d) any employer and other director, manager,
secretary or other. officer or agent acting on
behalf of such employer who, without sufficient
cause, fails to comply with provisions of sub-
section (2) of Section 42; or

(e) any person acquires or abets in the
acquisition of any property which is subject to a
charge under sub-section (1) of Section 40; or
(f) an officer or member of a society or any person
does any act in contravention of the rules; or

(g) any person willfully or without any reasonable
excuse disobeying any summons, requisition or
lawful written order issued under the provisions
ofthe Act; or

(h) any employer who without sufficient cause,
fails to pay to a Co- operative society the amount
deducted by him from its employee within a
period of fourteen days from the date on which
such deduction is made.

Explanation.-For the purposes of this section
an officer or amember referred to in this section
shall include past officer or past member, as the
case may be.”.



TG YWY, fAi® 7 STHaX! 2025 10 (13)

(1)

2)

@)

4

®)

4.

1960

27

Madhya Pradesh
Industrial Relations Act,
1960

(6) For Section 75, the following Section shall be
substituted namely:-

«75.Punishment for offences.—Every Board

of Directors, officer or past officer or member or
past member or an employee or past employee of
a society or any other person shall, without
prejudice to any action that may be taken against
him under any law for the time being in force, be
liable to be punished with fine not exceeding Rs.
50,000/~ provided that he is convicted of any
offence mentioned in Section 74.”.

(7) After Section 75, the following new section
shall be inserted, namely:-

“75-A. Penalties for Irregularities.-Every
Board of Directors, officer or past officer or
member or past member or an employee or past
employee of a society or any other person shall,
without prejudice to any action that may be taken
against him under any law for the time being in
force, be lable to be penalized by the Registrar
with a penalty not exceeding Rs. 25,000/- for
any irregularity mentioned in Section 74-A.”.

(1) After Section 93, the following Section shall
be added in Chapter XIV, namely:-
“93-A.Composition of offence —(1) An
officer not below the rank of Labour Officer, if
so authorised by the Labour Commissioner by
notification, may either before or after the
institution of proceedings under this Act, permit
any person charged with an offence to breach of
Sections 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92 and 93 of
this Act to compound the offence on payment of such
sum as may be prescribed by the said notification.

(2) On payment of amount of any legal dues
towards the employee under the Act, if any, and
on payment of such amount of compounding, as
provided under sub-section (1) by the authorized
officer,-

(a) the offender shall not be liable to any
prosecution; and



10 (14)

TIYSY J9uF, faid 7 SN 2025

1 @ 3) 4 ()
(b) if any such proceeding has already been
instituted against any person as aforesaid, such
person shall be discharged of such proceeding.”.
5. 1956 23 Madhya Pradesh (1) In Sections 165, 166, 302, 332, 344, 345,
Municipal Corporation 346, 346-A, for the word "fine", the word
Act, 1956 "penalty” shall be substituted.

(2) Section 170 and 171 shall be omitted.

(3) In Section 200, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "five hundred" the
word "five thousand" shall be substituted.

(4) For Section 201, the following Section shall
be substituted, namely:-

“201.Making or altering drains without authority.-
Whoever, without the permission of the
Commissioner makes or causes to be made,
oralters or causes to be altered, any drain,
leading into any of the drains vested in the
Corporation shall be punished with penalty which
may extend to five Thousand rupees and shall
pay any expense which may be incurred in
restoring the same.”.

(5) In Section 236, in sub- section (2), for the
word "fine", the word "penalty" and for the word
"five hundred" the word "five thousand" shall be
substituted.

(6) In Section 334, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "five hundred" the
word "five thousand" shall be substituted.

(7) For Section 335, the following section shall
be substituted, namely:-

“335. Bill-sticking without permission.-
(1) Whoever, without the consent of the owner
or occupier or other person for the time being in
charge of any property affixed or causes to be
affixed any poster, bill, notice, placard or other
paper or means. of advertisement against or upon
any street, building, wall, tree, board, fence or
pale or writes upon soils, defaces or marks any
such building, wall, tree, board, fence or pale with
chalk or paint or in any other way whatsoever,
shall be punishable with penalty which may



qgY<e Nro197, faid 7 SRl 2025 10 (15)

4)

(3)

extend to Two Thousand rupees. For purposes
of this sub-section, the commissioner may
presume, until the contrary is proved, that the bill,
notice, placard or other paper or means of
advertisement has been exhibited or affixed by
the person for whose benefits such advertisement
ismade.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in
sub-section (1), the Commissioner may by
public notice prohibit the use of any building or
part of a building, wall, tree, board, fence or pale
in any specified locality or a street without his
permission.

No person shall after such public notice make
use of any building, wall, tree, board, fence or
pale without his permission or in contravention
of such permission.

Whoever, without the permission or in
contravention of permission of the Commissioner,
uses any building, wall, tree, board, fence or pale,
shall be punishable with penalty which may
extend to two thousand rupees, or in case of a
second of subsequent breach to Five Thousand
Rupeses.

(8) In Section 343, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty", for the word "five hundred" the word
"five thousand" and for the word "fifty" the word
"hundred" shall be substituted.

(9) For Section 428, the following section shall
be substituted namely:-

“428. Penalties for breach of byelaws.-
(1) In making a byelaw under Section 427, the
Corporation may provide that a breach orany
abatement of a breach of it shall be punishable-

(a) with penalty may extend to five thousand
rupees and in the case of a continuingbreach,with
penalty which may extend to one hundred
rupees for each day during which the breach
continues after imposing the penalty for the first
breach; or



10 (16)

Teggee oT94, faTd 7 SI9ax) 2025

(1

@)

3)

4)

®)

6.

1961

37

Madhya Pradesh
Municipalities Act, 1961

(b) with penalty which may extend to ten rupees
for every day during which the breach continues
after receipt of written notice from the
Commissioner to discontinue the breach.

(2) In lieu of or in addition to such penalty, the
Commissioner may require the person toremedy
the mischief'so far as in his power.”.

(10) In Section 434, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty" shall be substituted and for sub-section
(2), the following sub- section shall be
substituted, namely:-

*(2) Whoever after having been punished of any
offence under clause (a) or (b) of sub-section
(1), continues to commit such offence shall be
punished for each day after the first during which
he continues so to commit offence, with penalty
which may extend to the amount mentioned in
the fourth column of the said table.”.

(1) In Section 145 and 228, for the word "fine",
the word "penalty" shall be substituted.

(2) In Section 179, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "five hundred" the
word "five thousand" shall be substituted.

(3) In Section 182, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "five hundred" the
word "five thousand" shall be substituted.

(4) In Section 185, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty”, for the word "twenty five" the word"five
hundred" and for the word "ten", the word "fifty"
shall be substituted.

(5) In Section 187, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "one thousand" the
word "five thousand" shall be substituted.

(6) In Section 194, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty”, for the word "two hundred and fifty"
the word "two thousand" and for the word "five",
the word "fifty" shall be substituted.

(7) In Section 198, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "twenty five" the word
"two hundred and fifty" shall be substituted.



TS o193, i 7 S 2025 10 (17)

1

(2)

(€))

(G))

®)

(8) In Section 212, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "twenty five" the word
"two hundred and fifty" shall be substituted.

(9) In Section 222, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "one hundred" the
word "one thousand" shall be substituted,

(10) In Section 224 for the word "fine" the word
"penalty", for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred" and for the word "ten", the word "fifty"
shall be substituted.

(11) In Section, 225 for the word "fine", the word
"penalty" and for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred” shall be substituted.

(12) In Section 226, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty", for the word "twenty five" the word
"two hundred and fifty" and for the word "ten",
the word "fifty" shall be substituted.

(13) In Section 239, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty” and for the word "twenty five" the word
"two hundred and fifty" shall be substituted.

(14) In Section 240, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty”, for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred" and for the word "five", the word "fifty"
shall be substituted.

(15) In Section 242, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty", for the word "twenty five" the word
"two hundred and fifty" and for the word "five",
the word "fifty" shall be substituted.

(16) In Section 255, for the word "fine" the word
"penalty”, for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred" and for the word "five hundred", the
word "two thousand" shall be substituted.

(17) In sub-section (2) of Section 260, for the
word "fine", the word "penalty" and for the word
"fifty" the word "five hundred" shall be
substituted.

(18) for sub-section (3) of Section 260, the
following sub- section shall be substituted,
namely:-



10 (18)

TIUSYT o9, {1 7 S=av) 2025

&)

@)

€))

@

©)

“(3) Upon aviolation being obtained in respect
of any place under sub-section (2), the Chief
Municipal Officer or any officer authorized by
him but not otherwise, order such place to be
closed, and there upon appoint persons or take
other steps to prevent such place being so used
and every persons or take other steps to prevent
such place after it has been so ordered to be
closed shall be punished with penalty which may
extend to fifty rupees for each day during which
he continues so to use, or permits such use of the
place after it has been so ordered to be closed.”.

(19)In sub-section (5) of Section 268, for the
word "fine", the word "penalty" and for the word
"fifty" the words "five hundred" shall be
substituted.

(20) for sub-section (6) of Section 268, the
following sub- section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(6) Upon a Violation being obtained in respect
of any place under sub-section (5) the Chief
Municipal Officer or any officer authorized by
him but not otherwise order such place to be
closed and thereupon appoint person or take
other steps to prevent such place being so used
and every person who so uses or permits the use
of a place after it has been so ordered to be
closed, shall be punishable with penalty which
may extend to fifty rupees for each day during
which he continues so to use, or permits such
use of, the place after it has been so ordered to
beclosed.”.

(21)In Section 272, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty”, for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred" and for the word "ten" the word "fifty"
shall be substituted.

(22)For sub-section (4) of Section 272, the
following sub-section shall be substituted namely:-

“(4) Upon a violation being obtained in respect
of any place under sub-section(3),the Chief
Municipal Officer or any other officer authorized



YT IoTuF, e 7 SO 2025 10 (19)

)]

@)

€))

*)

©)

by him but not otherwise, order such place to be
closed and thereupon, appoint persons or take
other steps to prevent such place being so used.”.

(23) For sub-section (2) of Section 283, the
following sub- section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“ (2) Whoever, after notice has been given under
sub-section(1), uses any building or place or
permits it to be used in such a manner as to be a
nuisance to the neighborhood or dangerous to
life, health or property, shall be punished with
penalty which may extend to two hundred
rupees and with further penalty which may
extend to five hundred rupees and with penalty
which may extend to fifty rupees for every day
on which such use or permission of use is
continued after the date of first violation.”.

(24) For sub-section (4) of Section 283, the
following sub- section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(4) Whoever uses without a license, or during
the suspension or after the withdrawal of a
license, any place for any purpose mentioned in
sub-section (1) in any Municipality in which
bye-laws are for the time being in force prescribing
the conditions on or subject to which, the
circumstances in which, and the areas or locality
in respect of which license for such use may be
granted, refused suspended or withdrawn, shall
be punished with penalty which may extend to
five hundred rupees and with further penalty which
may extend to fifty rupees for every day on which
such use is continued after the date of first
violation.”.

(25) In Section 285, for the word "fine", the word
"penalty", and for the word "fifty" the word "five
hundred" shall be substituted.

(26) In Section 300, for the word "Magistrate",
the words "Chief Municipal Officer", for the word
"fine", the word "penalty" and for the word "fifty"
the word"five hundred"shall be substituted.



10 (20) Y o9, faA e 7 S9Nt 2025
(OO 3) “4) )

7 1973 23 Madhya Pradesh Nagar  In Section 77, sub-section (2) shall be omitted.
Tatha Gram Nivesh
Adhiniyam, 1973

8 1973 44 Madhya Pradesh Society ~After Section 39, the following new Section shall
Registrikaran be inserted, namely:-
Adhiniyam, 1973 “39-A.Composition of offence. (1) In the event
(State Act) of a contravention of sub-section (4) of Section

16, Section 38, and Section 39 of this Act, the
Registrar may, upon payment of a sum of two
thousand five hundred rupees by the defaulting
society/office bearer/person,permit the
compounding of the said contravention under
the aforementioned sections.

(2) On payment of the compounding amount as
specified under sub-section (1), the defaulting
society/office bearer/ person shall be absolved
of the said contravention under the aforementioned
sections and shall not be liable for prosecution.”.

PRI, TS T TAT oG A, TR §RT AMEDHIT a1l GEolerd, WidTel § G ol Yeblia—2025.



