U J9EE< www.govtpressmp.nic.in q
off T dre T s weat .

FHHE 342] Wiure, wiaR, feiw 26 faam@k 2020—3nf¥aA 4, ¥ 1942

fafer ot faurn = faum

9ure, fediss 26 FaasR 2020

F. 11296-203-FFHH-3A(W.). —9RA & GfauH F S g 213 & I AYY & 0T §R yefyd foan
T Frefafad SRy GHHERY $ SHERI g Yehia fRa S E.

TEAYSY % TSGUT o H F T IR,
3T FAR, Afafiem wfa.

683



684

gy U9, T 26 faamk 2020

e .

FegqQ T IT
rfufrm waiew
R3 WY RuE
qer  srfufaw
FHIF 39 W
LRE&R E)
aeoTe w®U A
wyttaa T
WL

HeqU T IT
stfufram ®wHiw
R T R4& &l
LEICER

AU STEATCIT

HAS 3 T RoRo
ARy TRuTes faftr (e deiter ) 37eameyT, 00
[ ‘' HegeyT s ( errenur )’ ¥ fedies 38 faamy, 030 ol WUmER Yaiive ferar . ]
U VRS & Sheald 98 § Usguel gRT YEATua fhRar TR

Teyeyl TR Fm Afufay, (us a9 Heayey TR ifuf gy, 2R&e HI X Weifya &
G TR

Tq;, T % faum-Hed o1 99 =g F&l ¢ iR 9eauey & Toaure %1 98 SHgH 8 T R T
T offeafaai faemm ¥, f9F RO 98 oTewd® 81 T § % g SiER ay

3TqUd, SR % GFAHM & =8 23 & @UE () BRI YSd Al &l Wl H i g, AEA9Y
¥ T Frefafed Ry wenfud &=d € o —

Q. T ALY 1 GHW AW HEAYRY TRAfaw fafy (T TeEE) TRy, 030 §.

. TH IRV F Yodd & HIAEY F SR ASIURY TRUtaed fm afufram, jug
(T 3 T L]UE) T HEAYRY TRUMHT Ifufm, gR82 (SRATH 3o T RRER) ¥RT 3 ¥ ¥ H
fafifey deeri & oreaee WA g WWE gL

HAT-Tsh
Heayey TRUTes 7 SAfufad, g]us (FHIE 3 W ]UE) 1 GYNEH

3. TRy TRUfeEw Frm fufEm, (s (FHIF 3 T 2RjuE) H—
(2) u/I R H—
(F) 39N (R) H, @ (%) & @A R, Frfafaa @ve wnfa fear s, stefq—
‘(=) TRafAE &9 W g frated g feifad memR stafq wwmfd;
(@) SR (%) ¥ WA W, Fefafea souaw i@ s S, s —
“ (%) gfe ®1E RIS & TETIR F fafed F0 § oWwa ® A FE A€ qINg H
et =7 § orhd @, O durfefd, T8 FRufas a5 91 9 & W S

T ¥ o o8 9r & W T fatr sda) 9y F Sl ok 59 O
39 @ & 94 T8 S 39 erwfe e gwsn s



Heqyey Toe, T 26 faawx 2020 684 (1)

wig srfafem % e sreay o wfafa § § feet & Frafe =t wrfarfed],
T @ % fafea dfsa wa wfim =78 & s

(3) HT Qo H, 39U (¥) H, 9o g H, I 'Y AR & WM W, V= v W' wiiy
fep g,

(3) 9/ ¥ H,—
(F) 39EW () § wse undel " & U, wes faen WRTR'! sTwenfyd Ty =,
(@) 3uEm (R) # wsg unSl! F uve, wek f'ad memR’ et Fenfia o S,

(%) U Q- H, 3UEN () H, weg 'ung’’ % TN |, g ' HRIUR ieen wNg’ et
fepe S,

(4) oW -8 B, g Uy’ & W W, W TR Sveen ureg’ wenfyd feg S,
(&) URT -7 H, weg ‘'R’ F v, WeR ' HWeTdR'' St swenfyd fRy Wi,
(\0) W gy H,—

(%) o= O % UvEn, R A HeTdR'' Sig Wi,

(@) waw & wH R, FEfafes wigs wife e S sl —

“qig #1g ot et genfiefa, T & fed frafea § a1 weTdR % Tt
T, T ¥ 3ifue IR HagH TR SO

(¢) 9T & B, 39URT (3) ¥ wvE, Frefafga suum St s, i —
“ () afe IS saf weTdR 3iit arig ST wel % ford Fraffa <1 s &, < 34 it
Hiftyg fpy 917 1 9@ ¥ 9. &7 & i fodl © 98 ¥ 319 =T <
T
(R) HFI o H,—
u(a;) .qmé.sﬁﬁﬁ’ Wllmlla’?mwtcm W”\_yﬁgm
(@) 3STER (R) H—

(t) withre O, wse M ung! % TvEm, veS A1 TR ST sEefid TR S

() T (W) H wx Uy’ % 9vE, IS weTdR ! ot Tanfa T wmd,



684 (2) qegyey ey, faaid 26 faaw 2020

(M) SN (R) H—
() ed Y A, wee iy’ % U, v YA weTR S S
() e Y0 d, v ae” % gvEn, W A HeTiR! st wenfud faR ST
(@) @ (P F, W g ¥ e, e o TR’ Sk e f S,

(&) IR (3) H, v Cunfe’ SRl el ff 9% SN ¥, & WA W, Uk 'ung A

(20) 9RT Re-W H,—
(%) urd e, W g F W R, IR U HETER a9 urg! iy feew S

(@) IR (R) #, yRiE R A, v ydE g’ F TE W, I8 e a9
T® g’ wrfud e wd.

() I9ER (R) H, —

() TR e H, wee *urg’ STel el o 9% 3T Y, W TN W, WK ' HRTIR
T g’ Tefd fe g

(@A) wgE W, v o] F W W, wR AR A g wenfyq few S
(2%) ¥R 8¢ H,—
(%) Uwd WY ¥ s W, fefatea ued wid wenfad fe s, st —
" aremy (WY ) 1 i
(@) IR () H, e ‘9 HWenr' @ oy feman SQ
(RR) HRI R0 H, TR0l §, ¥eg ‘qur WETR'’ @ @ fwRAr S
(23) 9/ }3-F H,—

(F)  urvd e A qe S9Em () H, vee o merdk’’ Skl wel off 3 o g, & A
IERIESILS

(@) STER () FEve () 9, wee ' eree), ek F WM W, S TRTaR ' wenfua
fepan sie,



Heyey o, f&Aid 26 faamR 2020 684 (3)

(2¥) 9R1 3-& & TR, Frafafaa u@ siqenfua i Sg, steiq :—

“¥. () fret fm & Ue TRTUR SR STUAT U8 dwhldl R Y feal T 99eh STEN,  wamiik &t amd
Ifg I UG ik & oI @R, SiE % fafea #t S, 7 47 & AaqH &0 g e S
TGl F1 F G F MY | fE Aqgmstl & agAd g YW HagH 9 a9y
ENIRISLE

T AI9E g St UE IS Uik % 9 IR T & ST 5 9 o faffad andef
F P €& W § FH @4 A aR §RGEE W EKIER 7 QU S
3k S/ dyrier IR w1 wRga A & fean s

g I8 3R fm Tt i ufehar,—

(T#) 9 a0E 9, s fF twr mek faifaa ga @ @R e 18 yre & ®,
2 oY % wemEy & fiw; R

()  wRHER % ST g # fEifad g @ g d 9w weEfy w sndt Fematy #\
STaEH g T g,

T & I S

T ge 3R ot fF HRTdR & A" e W 9iea SEet QU TeEty §
TR E SIRE i ST,

()  Huriia o1, 19T THyH FR o SR I8 Hedfud &Y o o 9 fF I9-4m
() § fafifés - el 3 o998 o S9 F e W EEER w1
TS TS THR 1 AT 3R 759 TR 39 59 Frat=m s &y 3R .

(3) o9y g1 R, g fates emm, amg e S % e R), T G
St for fafea =t Se, Ao wOA F e won '

(W) UM ¥ H, 394 () H, @ (@) #, 39-wvs (dH) & WH R, Fefafaa 39-
gve wfud feran S, g —

Y (M) HRTOR % fretes %) g9 H, TRufas & & TR dagar gr.

HT-1
HeAYey WRATTeRT ifufam, 2’82 (ShHIE 39 T LR&R) I HHH

¥. YRyl WRUferh Ifufam, 2382 (hHI® 30 T R&R) H— Tegw T YT

sfufam ware

(R) 910 R H,— S AR
i,

(F) 39gw () ¥, @vs (F) & wr |, F=fafga @ve wfya fean Sy,
SIETTFL:—

“(w) TROfEE 89 ¥ yoae fatee g faffea st svufq gymfa (SeReds);”



684 (4) ey N9, f&is 26 faawr 2020

(@) 3N (¥) F @A R, FrEfafas soam wfa s S, s -
“y) Al P TR 8, ey %1 faleE A § sahd W© A FE 918, g
=1 fratet &0 9 o wd ®, df guifefa, W@ wRafas &8 @1 a8 & &M
# T F o B TR & i T4 Fraten safafea iy S Sl ek
I qF IH TWH R 9 TRl o 39 s e & 9§ wuen S

g At & ST e 0 witfad < farel & frafem w1 e,
T o 1 Frafe dfa wa i@ T8 s s

(R) 910 e B, I94W (R) ¥, @ (@) ¥, I9-@ve (d1) & wH W, Fefdafad sv-avs
Ty foan e, 1giq - —

“(AM) ey & Tafea ) g N TRuifas &9 % fedt Hagmr g1

(3) 9/ R H, U (¥) A, 90 Vs B, U< 'Y AR F WE R, Ik 9% A6’
Toqfad fw S,

(¥) ¥/ 3R H,—
(%) . ITuR () ¥, weg ‘uniS’ & WM W, we ' vl qon ug) wfya Ry Sg;
(@) 3uum (R) ¥, e Uil o T W, wsg ' sreAsdt qem e wnfia feh Sig;

(&) O 33-F H, 399N (3) & vsg g’ STei el off 9 A T, o WH W, g e
qen g’ enfud g Smd

(8) ¥R 3-@ #, vg 'Ug’ F WH W, K ‘' aremy au g’ w@iiya fRe S,
(©) ¥R 3R-T H, g g’ F WH W, WS U A ey’ wifua fey S,
(¢) umg 33 H—

(%) wRfys YA, v S avEm, wes A ey’ Slig WG

(@) foomm 9ige & WA R, frafafea Wgs i e S, g —

“qrg IS ot i Fenfeafa, oridl F fee fafem | @ sreaw & Tt
fraf=a A T 9 Ifus 9R TwaeH T SO

(R) 8T 3y &, wsg ' urdg % w9 A frate @ sy & 6, wes ' oremy % w9 F freie
7" eraFya few STd.

(Ro0) oI ¥3 H,—

(F) uvd ¥ H weg ‘ereaer qur’’ &1 A R SIg



Hqegyeyl Yois, fodis 26 faams) 2020

684 (5)

(@)

(m

IR (1) & ©F |, Fefafad 3uar wenfia 6t sy, a9iq —

‘(%) uRwg =1 reay qen Fraifad amig, uR Gy F I9EN (R) § AUiieE gum
dftwer ¥, fafea Ofd o Faffa ol & § sweas &1 g@ w4

IUYR (3) H, v ‘' ey qen’’ H1 < foean Sw

(22) 4R ¥3-% H,—

(%)

(@)

red 3 H o IuERT (R) H, s ‘‘aremy @ "' gl HEl off F I g, 1 A
[ERIESILE

YR (R) #, @ve (]) §, wsg ‘orems, IAY F W W, Uk ' IureAg’”’
Tenfya feanr S,

(RR) UW ¥& & TvEw, Fefafad gw e @ it S, el —

Hye, () Tordt aftog & Y 1=y g0 O W8 dchiel b Y fean man g s

Ifz 38 A wfra & ogEr, o ik fafed o sg, TRufae 85 & H7agH FE
I Hagaiel Fl Hod W= F MY ¥ fyT Aqg@ist % wgHd gRI T« HA<H
¥ 99 g ST

R ATGE AN 1 U HE IR 79 T SO TET A ST @ b fof Fraffea wrecf

F ol GE ¥ FH Y FH 99 AR 9l g wEE R gEER T w e S
3R 3§ FoRL B YA T W oA W

g T8 IR T i wfshar,—

(TH)

34 o A, frgs fe sty feifaa erar § R o1 9 grw & §, &
9 & wemEty & i@ ek :

()  AwEy & 39 g9 ¥ FEifaa g1 F w0 4 SEE yeEty & et wiermaty
IFgEH T T F,
IRTY &I I ST

()

€Y

W T8 R o o eTeael I a9 AT SH H AR SEH Fq agEfy § T
IR F ST T S

FHeFL T FHIEF H o 3R I8 T T A F 9w fh IwEm () #
fafafés F-<terd adel 3 a9 g S S T 1S 2, TEE T W
F o 3R ST WER W T el smam w1 fHide S

firfyr wr @Y W, g Frate @ 99" gae w9 % gead | @ O J, S
o fafgd &1 g, AaeH A & fad e S

ALY HT TUH
AT WL



684 (6) Yy N9, fedie 26 faam=r 2020
(R3) 91wy % M R, Fefafaa g wnfta «F S, et —

areror Fratee “yu. (1) g&1 TROTER Ty, fafsa miver & srgAica 9, Y& wEr faie &
% Uyt wed e e & ofieR Sureaet 1 Frafed &1 % W & fog faffaa afel = afteer

wftwer. AT

(R) SUUN (2) ¥ N AT T IREg F YoH Wi #1 ad wawl g Fw
fru e W@ fu BN, S FTifereT fteg o A feet Feeel &l U
ot F Fr=1 ug ot 1 7 € A TR R F AW H qeHieRR w98 Fuil 9
=1 ag goft =1 9 €1, &1 S iR 39 e § sfafdy 9w IueY s 9Reg
¥ gitmerl & IR # B, g9 W wimed % g@dg H arp g

g N FW A AfUHER FI TH FfFer § 7d @ 1 AfUEHR T
B SR mel % 9eR € #T <N H afiom o fafweg @l gra fean s

(2¥) "R 4 H, ik, fag, o1ar aun svifawm ' x3-, "' & 9REIq, 37 qe Srefars v,
SEREIECREIS

(W) 9W &3 §, SR (3) ¥, @us (dF) & T s H, 3, fo a oy ' a-F' F
U, o], 3 qul  SfHfawd Ar v, e nfya fee S

(28) 91 &3 B W B, v o’ & qE, Wk Uy ', I niua feg S

(29) ¥R 33¢ §, ITUM (2) #, @ (@) §, w=s ‘'eregey qu1’’ Wl el off 9 3 g,
H1 AT fwa S

G Yy FaameR, Qoo T,
TS

sfrare, feares 26 faamr 2020

. 11296-203-SFRIG-31(L.).—YRd & GEYH F IS 348 & @UE (3) & T H, HLAYRY TRUIfeTsh
fafy (gdta eNed) ey, 2020 (HHIE 13 §F 2020) FI ST FTAR TSI & WUHR ¥ TaegRT Fehiterd fmam
S g,

TEAYSY & TSI & A9 H a1 SRR,
YT AR, Afdfiss w=e.



qEYey I997, w26 faawr 2020

684 (7)

MADHYA PRADESH ORDINANCE

No. 13 oF 2020

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (TRITTYA SANSHODHAN)
ADHYADESH, 2020

[First published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 26th September, 2020.]
Promulgated by the Governor in the seventy first year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and
the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is
satisfied that cirecumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immedaite action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:—

1. This Ordinance may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Tritiya Sanshodhan)
Adhyadesh, 2020.

2. During the period of operation of this Ordinance, the Madhya Pradesh Municipal
Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956) and the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961
(No. 37 of 1961) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in Sections 3 and 4.

PART—I
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHDYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT, 1956
(NO. 23 OF 1956)

3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956),— (1) In
Section 9,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

a Mayor, that is Chairperson elected by direct election from the Municipal area,”.

“(a)
(b) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

If any municipal area fails to elect a Mayor on any ward fails to elect a
Councillor, fresh election proceedings shall be commenced for such Municipal
area or ward, as the case may be, within six months to fill up the seat and
until the seat is filled up it shall be treated as casual vacancy:

“(4)

Provided that proceedings of elecion of Speaker or any of the Committee under the

Act shall not be stayed, pending the election of such seat.”.

(2) In Section 10, in sub-section (4), in the first proviso, for the words “two months”, the
words “six months’ shall be substituted.

Short title.

Madhya Pradsh
Act No. 23 of
1956 and Act
No. 37 of 1961

to be
temporarily
amended.

Amendment to
the Madhya
Pradesh Act No.
23 of 1956.



684 (8) qegyey oge, fadis 26 faamsr 2020

(3) In Section 14,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the word “Councillors”, the words “and mayors” shall
be inserted;

(b) in sub-section (2), after the word “conuncillors”, the words “and Mayprs™ shall
be inserted.

(4) In Section 14-A, in sub-section (1), for the word “Councillor”, the words “Mayor or
Councillor” shall be substituted.

(5) In Section 14-B, for the word “Councillor”, the word “Mayor or Councillor” shall be
substituted.

(6) In Section 14-C,, after the word “Councillor”, the words “or a Mayor” shall be inserted.

(7) In Section 15,—
(a) after the word “Councillors”, the words “or Mayor” shall be added;
(b) for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that no person shall vote more than once in any election of the Councillors
or an election of the Mayor, as the case may be.™.

(8) in Section 16, after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“(4) If a person is elected for the Office of Mayor and Councillor both, he shall
have to resign from one of the offices within seven days from the date on
which he is declared elected.”.

(9) In Section 17,—

(a) in the marginal heading, after the word “Councillor”, the words “or Mayor™ shall
be added.

(b) in sub-section (l).—

(i) in the opening paragraph, after the words, “Councillor”, the words “or Mayor™
shall be inserted;

(ii) in clause (bb), after the word “Councillor”, the words “or Mayor* shall be
inserted.

(c) in sub-secction (2),—

(i) in the marginal heading, after the word “Councillor”, the words “or Mayor™
shall be added;

(i) in the opening paragraph, after the word “Councillor”, the words “or mayor”
shall be inserted;

(i) in clause (e), after the word “Councillor”, the words “or Mayor™ shall be
inserted.

(d) in sub-section (3), for the word “Councillor” wherever it occurs, the words
“Councillor or Mayor’ shall be substituted.



ey Teiqd, fedis 26 Taaw=r 2020 684 (9)

(10) In Section 17-B,—

(a) in the marginal heading, for the words “the Councillor”, the words “the Mayor
and the Councillor’® shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1), in the opening paraggraph for the words “Every Councillor”,
the words “Mayor and every Councillor” shall be substituted.
(¢) in sub-section (2),—

(i) in the opening paragraph, for the word “Councillor” wherever it occurs, the
words “Mayor or Conucillor” shall be substituted;

(ii) in the proviso, for the words “Councillor”’, the words “Mayor or Councillor”
shall be substotuted.

(11) In Section 18,—

(a) for the marginal heading, the following marginal heading shall be subslituted, ''Election

namely:— Speaker"';
“Election of Speakar™;
(b) in sub-section (1), the words “and Mayor” shall be omitted.
(12) In Section 20, in the Explanation, the words “and the Mayor™ shall be omitted.
(13) In Section 23-A,—
(a) in the marginal heading and in sub-section (1), the words “or Mayor” wherever
they occur shall be omitted;
(b) in clause (ii) of sub-section (2). for the words “Speaker, Mayor™, the word
”Mayor™ shall be substituted.
(14) After Section 23-A, the following section be, inserted, namely:— Recalling
Mayor.

“24. (1) Every Mayor of a Corpoation shall forthwith be deemed to have vacated his
office if he is recalled through a secret ballot by a majority of more than half
of the total number of voters of the corporation area casting the vote in
accordance with the procedure as may be prescribed:

Provided that no such process of recall shall be initiated unless a proposal is signed
by not less than three-fourth of the total number of the elected Councillors
and presented to the Divisional Commissioner:

Provided further that no such process shall be initiated,—

(i) within a period of two years from the date on which such Mayor is elected
and enters his offcie; and

(ii) in case Mayor is elected in a by-election, half of the period of tenure has
been expired:

Provided also that process for recall of the Mayor shall be initiated once in his whole
term.

of

of



684 (10) Teyey N9, T 26 faamk 2020

(2) the Divisional Commissioner, after satisfying himself and verifying that the three-
forth of the Councillors specified in sub-section (1) have signed the proposal
of recall, shall send the proposal to the State Government and the State
Government shall make a reference to the State Election Coommissios.

(3) On receipt of the reference, the State Election Commission shall arrange for voting
on the propoal of recall in such manner as may be prescribed.”.

(15) In Section 441, in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for sub-clause (iii), the followng sub-
clause shall be subtituted, namely:—
"(iii) in the case of election of Mayor, by any voter of the Municipal area.”.

PART—II

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHDYA PRADESH MUNICIPALITIES ACT, 1961
(NO. 37 oF 1961)

Amendment to 4. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961),—
the Madhya

Pradesh Act .
No. 37 of 1961. (1) In Section 19,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall be subtituted, namely:—

“(a) president, that is Chairperson, elected by the direct election from the Municipal
area;”.

(by for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

*(4) If any Municipal area fails to elect a President or any Ward fails to elect a
Councillor, fresh election proceedings shall be commenced for such
Municipal area or Ward, as the case may be, within six months to fill
up the seat, and until the seat is filled up, it shall be treated as casual
vacancy:

Provided that proceedings of election of Vice-President, or any of the Committes
under the Act shall not be stayed, pending the election of such seat.”.

(2) In Section 20, in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for sub-clause (iii), the following sub-
clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(iii) in the case of election of President by any voter of the Municipal area;”.

(3) In Section 29, in sub-section (4), in the first proviso, for the words “two months", the
words "six months’ shall be substituted.

(4) In Section 32,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the word “Councillor”, the words “Presidents and
Councillor™ shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the word “Councillors”, the words “presdidents and
Councillor” shall be substituted.

(5) In Section 32-A, in sub-section (1), for the word “Councillor” wherever it occurs, the
words “President and Councillor” shall be substituted.

(6) In Section, 32-B, for the word “Councillor”, the words “President and Councillor™ shall
be substituted.



ey Teiud, fedid 26 faawr 2020 684 (11)

(7) In Section 32-C, for the word "Councillor”, the words “Councillor” or President”
shall be substituted.

(8) In Section 33,—

(a) in the opening paragraph, after the word "Councillors”, the words "or President”
shall be added;

(b) for the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

"Provided that no person shall vote more than once in any election of the Councillor
or the President, as the case may be.”.

(9) In Section 35, before the words “election or nomination as a Councillor”, the words
“election as a President or’’ shall be inserted.

(10) In Section 43,—
(a) in the marginal heading, the words "the President and™ shall be omitted;
(b) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—
“(1) the President and the elected Councillors of the Council shall, at its first

meeting as referred to in sub-section (1) of Section 55 elect a Vice-
President from amongst the elected Councillors in the prescribed manner.”;

(c) in sub-section (3), the words “the President and™ shall be omitted.

(11) 1In Section 43-A,—

(a) in the marginal heading and in sub-section (1), for the words “the President or™
wherever they occur, shall be omitted;

(b) in clause (ii) of sub-section (2), for the word “President, Vice-President”, the
words “Vice-President™ shall be substituted.

(12) After Section 46, the following section shall be, inserted, namely:—

“47. (1) Every President of a Council shall forthwith be deemed to have vacated his Recalling
office if he is recalled through a secret ballot by a majority of more than  President.
half of the total number of voters of the Municipality area casting the vote
in accordance with the procedure as may be prescribed:

Provided that no such process of recall shall be initiated unless a proposal is signed
by not less than three-fourth of the total number of the elected Councillors

and presented to the Collector:
Provided further that no such process shall be initiated,—

(i) within a period of two years from the date on which such persident is elected
and enters his office; and

(ii) in case President is elected in a by-election, half of the period of tenure has
been expired:

of



684 (12)

qegyeyl TNT9H, fedis 26 faawa 2020

First meeting
after general
election.

Bhopal

Provided also that precess for recall of the President shall be initiated once in his whole
term.

(2) the Collector, after satisfying himself and verifying that the three-fourth of the
Councillors specified in sub-section (1) have the proposal of recall, shall send the proposal to the
State Government and the State Government shall make a reference to the State Election
Commission.

(3)  On receipt of the reference, the State Election Commission shall arrange for voting
on the proposal of recall in such manner as may be prescribed.”.

(13) For Section 55, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“55. (1) The Chief Municipal Officer shall, with the approval of the prescribed
authority, within fifteen days of every general election, call a meeting of the
elected Councillors for the purpose of electing Vice-President.

(2) The first meeting of the Council calied under sub-section (1) shall be presided
over by such officer not below the rank of Deputy Collector in the case of
Municipal Council and not below the rank of Tehsildar in the case of Nagar
Parishad, appointed by the Collector and all provisions contained in this
Chapter regarding meetings of the Council shall, as far as may be, apply in
respect of such meeting:

Provided that the presiding officer shall not have right to vote at such meeting and in
case of equality of votes, the result shall be decided by lot.™.

(14) In Section 56, after the figure, sign, letter and comma “43-A,”, the figure and
comma®“47,” shall be inserted.

(15) In Section 62, in sub-section (3), in the proviso to clause (iii), after the tigure, sign
and letter “43-A" the word, figure and comma “or 47.” shall be inserted.

(16) 1In Section 63, in the proviso, before the words “the Chairman”, the words “*Vice-
President or’’, shall be inserted.

(17) In Section 328, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), the words “President and’’ wherever
they occur shall be omitted.

ANANDIBEN PATEL

Dated the 25" September, 2020. Governor,

" Madhya Pradesh.

T, EEg HEOT g oREE W, TEIRY g WES FEd qRuned, Hiod @ gfsd a9 g —2020.



